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TRA31 - Transporter for Warhammer Underworlds: Shadespire + Nightvault

from 148,38 EUR
Item no.: 379912

shipping weight: 1.50 kg
Manufacturer: Feldherr

Product Description
If you haven't been bitten by the bug for the Mirrored City of Shadespire after the first season, you won't be able to resist the magic of Warhammer Underworlds after the second
instalment "Nightvault".And for those who want to keep their warrior models safe afterwards, there's now this great complete package with all the foam inserts for the 16 Hosts and
the Arcane Dangers, spread over three storage boxes. As a bonus, there is a fourth storage box M so that you are ready for the upcoming third season. Alternatively, you can also
use it to store game boards and other accessories.All of this fits into the transporter bag. So you can take your entire Warhammer Underworlds collection with you at all times.From
Averon Stormfather and Sanson Farrunner to Zarbag's scurrying goblin flock, every troop gets a customised Feldherr foam insert.The compartments are individually tailored to the
miniatures. This means that the models are well protected in the soft foam. Sensitive details are thus protected from damage.The customised cut ensures that the figures do not
slide around during transport. Painted warrior models are spared scratches and chipped colours.An additional compartment is reserved under each figure for the power and mission
cards. Up to 40 cards (also with sleeves) can be stored here. Deck boxes also fit here. Dice and markers can be sorted into the remaining four compartments.As you can never
have enough dice, there is also a mat for up to 77 dice on top.For the "Arcane Dangers" you get an insert with eight customised compartments for all six terrain pieces:- Throne-
Fire bowl with skulls- 3 pyramid-shaped ruins held by chains- 2 pyramid-shaped ruins shrouded in smoke- Destroyed statue- VinesFinally, the included foam lids ensure that your
figures are safely packed all round and survive transport to the Mirrored City undamaged.The storage boxes are made of coated, double-walled cardboard. This makes them not
only lightweight, but also particularly robust and therefore ideal for storing your miniatures safely and protected from dust. You can transport the boxes using the plastic carrying
handle.Dimensions of storage box M:- Internal dimensions: 345 mm x 275 mm x 150 mm height- The external dimensions are slightly larger.If you want to take your entire
Warhammer Underworlds collection with you, simply pack the boxes in the Feldherr transporter, which is also included in the set. This is made from lightweight but durable fabric. In
addition to the large main compartment, the bag has a small side compartment, e.g. for rulebooks. It can be lifted with two carrying handles or shouldered comfortably with the
sturdy carrying strap.Dimensions of the Transporter bag:- Internal dimensions: approx. 620 mm x 400 mm x 340 mm Height- External dimensions: approx. 635 mm x 410 mm x 350
mm height- Front compartment: 230 mm width x 210 mm heightThe set includes:- 1 Feldherr Transporter Bag- 4 Feldherr Storage Boxes M- 1 Half-Size Foam Insert for
"Stormfather's Cursebreaker" (HSMEHA050BO)- 1 Half-Size Foam Insert for "Thorns of the Rose Queen" (HSMEGZ050BO)- 1 half-size foam inlay for "Eyes of the Nine"
(HSMEHE050BO)- 1 half-size foam inlay for "Zarbags Gitz" (HSMEHF050BO)- 1 half-size foam inlay for "Hunt of the Nine" (HSMEHE050BO)foam inlay for "Hunt of the Gods"
(HSMEJS050BO)- 1 half-size foam inlay for "Mollogs Mob" (HSMEJT060BO)- 1 half-size foam inlay for "Thundrik's Profit Hunter" (HSMENE050BO)- 1 half-size foam inlay for
"Ylthari's Guardians" (HSMENF050BO)- 1 half-size foam inlay for "Zwistklaue's Swarm" (HSMEBD050BO)- 1 half-size foam inlay for "Thefoam inlay for "The Chosen Axes"
(HSMEBC040BO)- 1 half-size foam inlay for "The Grave Guard" (HSMEBB035BO)- 1 half-size foam inlay for "Khorne's Bloodband" (HSMEBA040BO)- 1 half-size foam insert for
"Stormcast Eternals" (HSMEAZ050BO)- 1 half-size foam insert for "Iron Skulls Jungz" (HSMEAY045BO)- 1 half-size foam insert for "Thefoam inlay for "The Far Runners"
(HSMECC050BO)- 1 half-size foam inlay for "Magore's Fiends" (HSMECB050BO)- 1 half-size foam inlay for "Arcane Dangers" (HSMEHC060BO)- 1 half-size foam insert for 77
cubes (HSLN025BO)- 2 full-size nubbed foam inserts for the fourth storage box M (FSNP020)- 3 foam lids- High-quality, fine-pored foam, foam - Made in Germany- Chlorine-free
and acid-free
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