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QUAK-3D - Organiser for The Quacksalvers of Quedlinburg + The Herbal Witches -
Basic Game Box

from 15,16 EUR
Item no.: 379396

shipping weight: 0.30 kg
Manufacturer: Feldherr

Product Description
Oh, those were the days. When you could still tinker and brew whatever you wanted, without food inspectors and drug laws. Like every year, you meet up with your fellow tincture
brewers in tranquil Quedlinburg, buy all kinds of ingredients for your concoctions and mix what the kettle can hold. But be careful, because just one wrong ingredient and everything
blows up.And to make sure that doesn't happen to you, we support you with this Feldherr organiser set made of sturdy plastic. You can organise everything neatly and clearly in the
customised trays and put it straight from the box onto the game board at the start of the game. This saves valuable time and nerves.- The organiser offers space for all game
materials from the "Die Quacksalber von Quedlinburg" base game and the "Die Kräuterhexen" expansion from eggertspiele.- The original cardboard insert is required to store the
token and card holders in the game box.- Larger components, such as the ingredient books, bottles and cloth bags, are stored separately.- The cauldrons (player boards) and the
victory point track are on top.- All cards fit in the card holder even with sleeves.- No assembly required. All parts are ready for immediate use.Save yourself the time-consuming task
of organising and arranging chips, cards and accessories at the start of each game. With the Feldherr token boxes and the card holder, everything is now compactly stored and
always where you need it. From rubies to ingredient chips and rat tokens - every chip, every wooden marker and every card has its own compartment. This makes it easier for you
to sort things after the game.With the organiser, you can always find what you need straight away and, thanks to the individually designed compartments, you can see immediately if
a piece is missing. At the same time, this storage system reliably protects the game material against creases and other wear and tear.At the start of the game, simply take the token
and card holders out of the box and spread them out on the game table. This leaves you more time for the game and you can concentrate fully on brewing your concoctions.The
plastic inserts are stored in the two free compartments of the original cardboard insert. The centre compartment contains:1 tray for wooden markers, starting ingredient chips, rubies
and seal tokens- in the large tray, the two token holders for the starting ingredient chips and the wooden markers (drops, victory point markers, (drops, victory point markers, rat
tokens) stacked on top of each other- the compartment next to it serves as a tray for the rubies- plus five slots for the seal tiles1 card holder for fortune cards- one compartment for
fortune cards (also fits with card sleeves)- one compartment for the "Flame" round marker- one compartment for the dice- three compartments for the witch tokens three
compartments for the witch pennies5 token holders for ingredient chips- two large token holders with six compartments each for sorting the ingredient chips- three small token
holders with two compartments each for sorting the ingredient chipsThe second elongated compartment in the cardboard insert of the original box is equipped with:- a small token
holder with two compartments for sorting the ingredient chips- larger cardboard pieces, such as bottles, ingredient books and cloth bagsFinally, place the cauldrons (player boards)
and the victory point track on top and your game is packed.The set contains:- 1 tray with two plastic token holders for wooden markers and starting ingredient chips- 4 plastic token
holders, each with 2 compartments for ingredient chips- 2 plastic token holders, each with 6 compartments for ingredient chips- 1 plastic card holder for fortune cards, markers and
dice- 1 foam lid- thermoplastic- no assembly required - ready to play- 3D printed in GermanyAs with all 3D printed models, minor imperfections may occur. The product images are
only examples of what the finished product may look like. All products are provided unpainted.
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