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shipping weight: 1.50 kg
Manufacturer: Feldherr

Product Description
The Warchest pledge of the Kickstarter campaign for "The Edge: Dawnfall v1.6" is quite something. The entire package weighs over 9kg. Transporting so many miniatures and
game material without help could lead to disaster.Fortunately, we are not afraid of a challenge and have the right transporter set to tame your pledge. The set offers space for all
miniatures and the entire game material of the basic game, the Darkness expansion, as well as all unlocked stretch goals of the Kickstarter campaign. This allows you to transport
everything compactly packed and well protected to your next game night without breaking anything or causing a hernia.- All miniatures, game cards and the complete accessories of
the Warchest Pledge from the Kickstarter campaign for "The Edge: Dawnfall v1.6" can be stored in the transporter set.- Game materials such as tokens and cards are stored in their
own storage boxes with token and card holders.- All game cards also fit with protective sleeves.- Game boards can be stowed on the side of the transporter, or stored together with
the instructions and campaign booklets in one of the FSLB250.- The original, faction-specific plastic inserts are not required for storage in the transporter set.The following sets fit in
the transporter:- The Edge: Dawnfall v1.6 - Warchest- The Edge: Darkness - Expansion- All unlocked stretch goals from the Kickstarter campaignThe set consists of:1 Feldherr
transporter bag:1 Feldherr storage box FSLB250 filled with:- 2 foam inserts with 3 compartments each for giant miniatures such as Bell Crow, Angel of Death, Son of Khyber,
Shatterer, Infinity Angel, Anathema (HSCR080BO)- 1 foam insert with 32 compartments for standard infantry such as Bladebreeder, Berserker, Pilgrim, Ranger, Slaughter Crows,
Impostor, Shadow (FSMEDS040BO)- 1 foam insert with 24 compartments for wider models such as Holy Knight, Flame Keeper, Unbroken, Drillers, Stream Guard, Stream Surfer,
Source Blade + Artifact Miniatures (FSMFEV050BO)- 1 foam insert with 16 compartments for large miniatures such as Holy Knight, Purge Doctor, Prime Shadow, Void Specter,
Gorehound, Succubus, Ancient Guard (FSMEFP060BO)- 1 studded foam lid1 Feldherr storage box FSLB250 filled with:- 1 foam insert with 32 compartments for standard infantry
such as Master of Elements, Dark Scholar, Bloodsmith, Enkindled, Wyrm, Tree Maid, Storm Bringer + Artifact Miniatures (FSMEDS040BO)- 4 foam inserts with 7 compartments
each for miniatures of various sizes such as Abyssal Empress, Berserker, Harvester, Fleshripper, Forest Wraith, Blight Steed, Warbeast, Oracle of Wrath, Driller, Enkindled,
Gyrobot, Avenger, Holy Riders, Jump Suit, Storm Bringer, World Eater Heart (HSMEME080BO)- 1 foam cover2 Feldherr storage boxes FSLB055 each filled with:- 4 plastic card
holders, each with one compartment for playing cards- 2 plastic card holders, each with two compartments for playing cards- 1 plastic token holder with two compartments for small
game material- 1 plastic token holder with three compartments for small game material- 2 plastic token holders, each with four compartments for small game material- 2 foam
lidsTwo storage boxes, filled to the brim with ten customised foam inserts, as well as 2 card boxes with tokens and card holders ensure that all miniatures and game material from
the Warchest Pledge of The Edge: Dawnfall v1.6 are safely and neatly stored.From the faceless Berserker, to the repulsive Anathema, to the World Eater Heart - every miniature
has the right compartment here. Surrounded by soft, fine-pored foam, your figures are optimally protected from damage even during transport through the turmoil of time. You don't
need to worry about scratches and chipped paint on your painted figures or broken details on your miniatures.To ensure that your game material is also neatly packed, we have also
included two card boxes in the set. In the card and token holders, you can organise the various playing cards, dice, faction tokens, cardboard tokens and plastic tokens as you wish.
The cards also fit into the card holders with protective sleeves.The supplied foam covers ensure that miniatures and game material are well protected from all sides and cannot fall
out of the compartments.Finally, stow the game boards in the side of the transporter or pack them together with the instructions and campaign booklets in one of the two FSLB250
storage boxes.Everything is well stowed away in the high-quality Feldherr storage boxes FSLB250 and FSLB055. These are made of coated, double-wall cardboard in a discreet
Feldherr design. The lightweight material and carrying handle make them ideal for clearly organised storage and easy transport of your collection.The high-quality transporter bag is
made of lightweight but durable fabric. In addition to the large main compartment, it has a small side compartment in which, for example, writing materials, game instructions or
similar items can be stored. It can be carried with two handles or shouldered comfortably with the sturdy shoulder strap. When the bag is not in use, it can be folded flat to save
space and easily stored in the cupboard.Transporter dimensions:- Inside: approx. 620 mm long x 390 mm wide x 340 mm high- Outside: approx. 635 mm long x 410 mm wide x 350
mm high- Front compartment: 230 mm wide x 210 mm highDimensions of storage box FSLB250:- Inside: 345 mm x 275 mm x 250 mm high- Outside: 355 mm x 290 mm x 260 mm
highDimensions of storage box FSLB055:- Inside: approx. 345 mm x 275 mm x 55 mm- Outside: approx. 365 mm x 290 mm x 60 mmThe foam inserts have the following
dimensions:- HSCR080BO / HSMEME080BO: 275 mm x 172 mm x 70 mm total height (60 mm usable height + 10 mm base)- FSMEDS040BO: 345 mm x 275 mm x 40 mm total
height (30 mm usable height + 10 mm foam base)- FSMFEV050BO: 345 mm x 275 mm x 50 mm total height (40 mm usable height + 10 mm foam base)- FSMEFP060BO: 345 mm
x 275 mm x 60 mm total height (50 mm usable height + 10 mm foam base)- high-quality, fine-pored foam- chlorine-free and acid-free- Made in GermanyAs with all 3D-printed
models, minor imperfections may occur. The product images are only examples of what the finished product may look like. Colours may vary. All products are supplied unpainted.-
thermoplastic- no assembly required - ready to play- 3D printed in Germany
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