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Product Description
With your subscription, you have taken the plunge into the dark 41st millennium and your army is growing by the month. Now that the first miniatures have been painted, you're
wondering how best to store them.Here's your answer. With this foam-filled Feldherr storage box in the practical transporter bag, you can ensure that your plague marines and
space marines arrive safely at the gaming table at all times.The set includes:- 1 Feldherr transporter bag- 1 Feldherr storage box DSLB310- 1 full-size foam insert for Chaos Rhino,
Myphitic Blight-hauler, Plagueburst Crawler + - 4 miniatures (FSMEFM090BO)- 1 full-size foam tray for 25 miniatures (FSLQ050BO)- 1 full-size foam tray for 32 miniatures
(FSMEDS050BO)- 3 half-size foam trays for 7 miniatures each (HSLZ060BO)- 3 half-size foam inserts for 10 miniatures each (HSMEFF050BO)- 1 half-size foam insert for Primaris
Repulsor (HSMEGC0090BO)- 1 half-size foam insert for Landspeeder + Bike Squad (HSMEJK100BO)- 1 half-size foam inlay for Redemptor Dreadnought (HSMECS110BO)- 1
half-size foam inlay for 6 miniatures (HSMECO060BO)- 1 half-size foam inlay for 16 miniatures (HS035BF05BO)- 1 half-size foam inlay for 3 miniatures (HSMECS110BO)foam
insert for 3 miniatures (HSDF085BO)- 1 half-size foam insert for 10 miniatures (HSLM050BO)- 1 foam coverThe box offers space for all Space Marines and Death Guard units from
the Warhammer 40.000 Conquest series from GamesWorkshop and Hachette.A total of 13 half-size and 3 full-size foam inserts provide a safe home for your models. Embedded in
high-quality, soft foam, the many intricate details of your models are protected from breakage and other damage. The colours and decals of the painted miniatures are also safe
from abrasion and scratches.A full-size insert takes care of the vehicles in your Death Guard. It offers customised compartments for the Chaos Rhino, the Myphitic Blight-hauler and
the Plagueburst Crawler. The remaining compartments are filled with character models: Lord of Contagion, Biologus Putrifier, as well as for Lord Fethius and his Tainted Cohort.The
6 rectangular compartments have the following dimensions:- 4 compartments: 70 mm long x 52 mm wide x 80 mm deep- 1 compartment: 60 mm long x 52 mm wide x 80 mm deep-
1 compartment: 65 mm long x 52 mm wide x 80 mm deepThe half-size insert with the 3 large compartments is reserved for the Foetid Bloat-drone.- Each of the 3 compartments is
152 mm long x 52 mm wide x 80 mm deep. Each of the 3 compartments is 152 mm long x 80 mm wide x 75 mm deep.An insert is specially designed for the Repulsor. It offers a
customised compartment for the Primaris Repulsor, which is precisely tailored to the Primaris Space Marines armour.The turret gets the small compartment next to it.You also get a
custom insert for the Redemptor Dreadnought. Here you have space for two models, because you can never have enough of these powerful war machines.The landspeeder and
the bike squad are stored in the HSMEJK100BO.The 5 compartments have the following dimensions:- 4 compartments: 78 mm long x 60 mm wide x 90 mm deep- 1 compartment:
137 mm long x 78 mm wide x 90 mm deepCharacter models with expansive details (e.g. Malignant Plague Caster, Nauseous Rotbone, Typhus, Inceptors and Attack Bikes) feel
right at home on the HSLZ060BO.The 7 compartments have the following dimensions:- 2 compartments: 54 mm long x 85 mm wide x 50 mm deep- 2 compartments 50 mm long x
70 mm wide x 50 mm deep- 1 compartment: 60 mm long x 75 mm wide x 50 mm deep- 1 compartment: 67 mm long x 75 mm wide x 50 mm deep- 1 compartment: 50 mm long x 75
mm wide x 50 mm deepYour Poxwalkers and Chaos Cultists will fit on the full-size insert with 32 compartments and the HS035BF05BO.- Each of the 32 compartments is 54 mm
long x 35 mm wide x 40 mm deep.- Each of the 16 compartments of the half-size insert is 54 mm long x 35 mm wide x 25 mm deep.The FSLQ050BO is reserved for the Plague
Marines and the Champion.- Each of the 25 compartments is 54 mm long x 41 mm wide x 40 mm deep.And finally, the Chaos Spawn also get their shelter in the form of the
half-size tray with 6 equally sized compartments.Each of the 6 compartments is 73 mm long x 80 mm wide x 50 mm deep.Your Reivers, Hellblasters, Intercessors and other
standard units get 3 inserts with 10 compartments each.The 10 compartments have the following dimensions:- 8 compartments: 54 mm long x 41 mm wide x 40 mm deep- 2
compartments: 54 mm long x 93 mm wide x 40 mm deepAnd finally, the Aggressors also get a safe home in the form of the HSLM050BO half-size insert.The 10 compartments have
the following dimensions:- 4 compartments: 64 mm long x 44 mm wide x 40 mm deep- 4 compartments: 60 mm long x 44 mm wide x 40 mm deep- 1 compartment: 75 mm long x 40
mm wide x 40 mm deep- 1 compartment: 50 mm long x 40 mm wide x 40 mm deepThe included foam lid seals the deal and ensures that the miniatures in the top tray are also
prepared for the next battle.The FSLB310 storage box is made of coated, double-wall cardboard and is therefore very light yet sturdy. The attachable lid reliably protects the
contents from dust and other external influences. The two plastic-reinforced carrying handles on the sides make the box easy to transport.The box fits into our transporter bag made
of lightweight but durable fabric. In addition to the large main compartment, the bag has a small side compartment. It can be lifted with two carrying handles or comfortably
shouldered with the sturdy carrying strap.Transporter bag dimensions:- Internal dimensions: approx. 620 mm x 400 mm x 340 mm Height- External dimensions: approx. 635 mm x
410 mm x 350 mm height- Front compartment: 230 mm width x 210 mm heightDimensions of the DSLB310 storage box:- Internal dimensions: 560 mm x 360 mm x 310 mm-
External dimensions: 590 mm x 380 mm x 320 mm- High-quality, fine-pored foam - Made in Germany- Chlorine-free and acid-free

Specifications



Scan this QR code to
view the product

All details, up-to-date
prices and availability

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

