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MEPLUS20 - MEDIUM PLUS Bag for Warhammer Quest: The Cursed City -
Miniatures

from 50,20 EUR
Item no.: 378246

shipping weight: 0.30 kg
Manufacturer: Feldherr

Product Description
Transport all 60 miniatures from the base game safely in the comfortable shoulder bag.You don't need an extra solution for transporting all the accessories and are simply looking
for a convenient way to bring your miniatures safely from A to B?Here is the right bag for your models.- The bag offers space for all 60 miniatures from the "Warhammer Quest: The
Cursed City" base game by GamesWorkshop.- Additional space for up to 18 more miniatures. Additional space for up to 18 more miniatures.The set contains:- 1 Feldherr MEDIUM
PLUS bag- 1 full-size foam inlay with 25 compartments (FSLQ040BO)- 1 half-size foam inlay with 10 compartments (HSBE050BO)- 1 half-size foam inlay with 12 compartments
(HS050I012BO)- 1 half-size foam inlay with 12 compartments (HS050I012BO) - 1 half-size foam inlay with 10 compartments (HSBE050BO) 1 half-size foam insert with 15
compartments (HSMEDR065BO)- 1 half-size foam insert with 16 compartments (HS035BF05BO)- 1 foam lidOne full-size and 4 half-size foam inserts offer you enough space, to
guide your hero, enemy and object models safely into the cursed city. Each model has its own custom-fit compartment to prevent them from sliding around and bumping into each
other on the way. The finely detailed miniatures are perfectly protected and intricate details are spared from damage. Once you have painted your models, you can be sure that the
colours will remain intact even after transport.Dimensions of the compartments:FSLQ050BO- Each of the 25 compartments is 54 mm long x 41 mm wide x 30 mm
deep.HSBE050BO- 4 compartments: 70 mm x 42 mm x 40 mm, one corner rounded with a radius of 20 mm- 4 compartments: 70 mm x 42 mm x 40 mm- 2 compartments: 70 mm x
52 mm x 40 mmHS050I012BO- Each of the 12 compartments is 54 mm long x 41 mm wide x 40 mm deep.HSMEDR065BO- 2 compartments: 92 mm long x 75 mm wide x 55 mm
deep- 4 compartments: 50 mm long x 50 mm wide x 55 mm deep- 8 compartments: 33 mm long x 28 mm wide x 55 mm deep- 1 compartment: 32 mm long x 25 mm wide x 55 mm
deepHS035BF05BO- Each of the 16 compartments is 54 mm long x 35 mm wide x 25 mm deep.Finally, a foam lid ensures that your figures are securely packed all round and
ideally equipped for transport.The Feldherr MEDIUM PLUS bag is made of particularly hard-wearing material. Padded side panels and a reinforced base also ensure that the
miniatures are well protected from external influences, even when being transported by car or train.In addition to the large main compartment, the bag also has a small compartment
with a zip at the front. Here you can store booklets and other small items, for example.There is a rubberised, handy carrying handle on the top. If you prefer to have your hands free,
you can also carry the bag comfortably as a shoulder bag thanks to the sturdy, detachable shoulder strap.Dimensions of the foam inserts:- FSLQ040BO: 345 mm x 275 mm x 40
mm total height (30 mm usable height + 10 mm foam base)- HSBE050BO / HS050I012BO: 275 mm x 172 mm x 50 mm total height (40 mm usable height + 10 mm foam base)-
HSMEDR065BO: 275 mm x 172 mm x 65 mm total height (55 mm usable height + 10 mm foam base)- HS035BF05BO: 275 mm x 172 mm x 35 mm total height (25 mm usable
height + 10 mm foam base)MEDIUM PLUS bag dimensions:- Internal dimensions: approx. 345 mm x 275 mm x 150 mm- External dimensions: approx. 390 mm x 330 mm x 160
mm- High-quality, fine-pored foam - Made in Germany- Chlorine-free and acid-free
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