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ME87BO - MEDIUM bag for Batman: Miniature Game 3rd Edition - Back to Gotham
Player Box

from 50,20 EUR
Item no.: 378219

shipping weight: 0.10 kg
Manufacturer: Feldherr

Product Description
Practical Feldherr bag for storing and transporting the "Back to Gotham" player box and "The Court of the Owls Talon's Night" set for the Batman: Miniature Game. In addition to
familiar foes such as Harley Quinn and Deadshot, Batman also encounters the Court of the Owls this time. No matter who gets in the way of the Dark Knight, your miniatures and
game material are always well protected in this Feldherr MEDIUM bag.- The set offers space for all contents of the "Back to Gotham" player box and the "Court of the Owls Talon's
Night" for the 3rd edition of the Batman: Miniature Game from Knight Models.- All game cards also fit with protective sleeves.- The modular assortment box for the Batman:
Miniature Game. The modular assortment box for the game material can be customised to your requirements.- You can store the rulebook on the foam cover.The contents of the
following sets fit completely in the bag:- Batman: Miniature Game 3rd Edition - Back to Gotham Player Box- Batman: Miniature Game 3rd Edition - The Court of the Owls Talon's
NightWe have packed 2 half-size foam inserts in the bag to protect your miniatures. Whether Batman crosses swords with Harley Quinn or a member of the Court of the Owls, each
miniature is given a suitable compartment.Thanks to the custom-fit cut, the miniatures sit firmly in their compartments. Even when being transported over the bodies of defeated
enemies, the figures do not slip and remain in place. The soft, fine-pored foam protects intricate details from breaking off and the colours of your coloured models from scratches
and paint abrasion.Your playing cards are also well looked after. The set comes with a half-size foam insert with corresponding card compartments. All playing cards can be neatly
stored here. The insert is complemented by a plastic card holder. This fits into one of the card slots. This means you can also keep your mini cards neatly organised. Of course, all
cards also fit with protective sleeves.The set includes a plastic assortment box for your game material. This has a modular design. This allows you to organise it according to your
own ideas and store your game material as you wish.Finally, a foam lid ensures that your figures are securely packed and protected for transport to the gaming table. You can place
the rulebook on the lid.The Feldherr MEDIUM bag is made from particularly hard-wearing material. Padded side panels and a reinforced base ensure that the miniatures are well
protected even when transported by car or train.In addition to the large main compartment, the bag has a small compartment with a zip at the front. Here you can store a notebook
or larger game material, for example.There is a rubberised, handy carrying handle on the top. If you prefer to have your hands free, you can also carry the bag comfortably as a
shoulder bag thanks to the sturdy, detachable shoulder strap.The set contains:- 1 Feldherr MEDIUM bag- 1 half-size foam insert for 12 miniatures (HSCW075BO)- 1 half-size foam
insert for 12 miniatures (HS050I012BO)- 1 half-size foam insert for playing cards and playing material + plastic card holder for the mini cards (HSMEQO050BO + 60432)- 1
assortment box (FHBOX01)- 1 foam mat, 5 mm, as height levelling- 2 foam mats, 10 mm, as height levelling- 1 foam lidDimensions of the MEDIUM bag:- Inside: approx. 345 mm x
275 mm x 120 mm- Outside: approx. 390 mm x 330 mm x 140 mmThe foam inserts have the following dimensions:- HSCW075BO: 275 mm x 172 mm x 75 mm total height (65 mm
usable height + 10 mm foam base)- HS050I012BO / HSMEQO050BO: 275 mm x 172 mm x 50 mm total height (40 mm usable height + 10 mm foam base)- high-quality, fine-pored
foam - Made in Germany- chlorine-free and acid-freeAs with all 3D-printed models, minor imperfections may occur. The product images are only examples of what the finished
product may look like. Colours may vary. All products are supplied unpainted.- thermoplastic- 3D printed in Germany
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