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KDM_03 - Complete set for KDM Wave 1 & 2: All monsters

from 171,31 EUR
Item no.: 377440

shipping weight: 0.50 kg
Manufacturer: Feldherr

Product Description
The miniatures from Kingdom Death: Monster 1.5 + 1.6 are some of the most unusual and crazy in the entire board game universe. Of course, exclusive models such as Phoenix,
Sunstalker or Dragon King are also very valuable - and in a few years may even be a little treasure. So our recommendation: guard your monsters like the apple of your eye! With
our complete set for KDM 1.6 Wave 1 & 2, we offer you a customised solution for storing the basic game, the 1.6 Update Pack and all twelve Wave 2 expansions.The inlays for the
large Phoenix, Spidicules, Sunstalker and Dragon King miniatures are in two parts. They each consist of a lower tray with a base and an upper tray without a base. As soon as you
have placed the models in the lower inserts, place the upper, precisely cut inserts on top. This way, your large monsters are well packed all round.Information- Keep everything
organised: All monsters from Wave 1 & 2 can be stored in 16 high-quality foam inserts. Large figures such as Spidicules and Phoenix have their own personalised inlays just for
them. You can sort the many small and medium-sized models (and some pin-ups) into the other inlays as you wish. This means you always have Slenderman, Old Survivor,
Kingsman & Co. in view.- Makes it easier to set up the game: Thanks to the new overview, you can always find the figure you need. Your game set-up is done in no time at all.-
Offers comprehensive protection: Our fine-pored inlays provide filigree models such as Spidicules and Phoenix with the best possible protection against parts breaking off. The
spider won't have a leg bent, the proud bird can still spread its magnificent wings the day after tomorrow.- Reliably prevents scratches: If you have painted your models, our
velvety-soft foam is the best insurance against scratches or chipped paint. Your monsters will shine in the spotlight and remain in top condition for posterity.- Enables space-saving
storage: Our inlays are stackable and therefore easy to store. Once you have sorted the minis, put everything on the shelf - all traces of the game night are gone and everything is
tidy again.Details- high-quality, fine-pored foam - Made in Germany- chlorine-free and acid-freeContents- 1 x two-piece double-size insert for Spidicules, Sunstalker and 3 other
miniatures (DSMEET100BO + DSMEEU080)- 1 x two-piece full-size inlay for Dragon King and 2 other miniatures (FSMEFG110BO + FSMEFH100)- 1 x two-piece full-size inlay for
Phoenix and 6 other miniatures (FSLX070BO + FSLY100)- 1 x full-size inlay for Gorm, Lion God and Lonely Tree and 1 additional miniature (FSMEFJ145BO)- 4 x half-size inlays
with 9 compartments each for miniatures (HS040I004BO)- 2 x half-size inlays with 10 compartments each for miniatures (HSLM050BO)- 2 x full-size inlays with 25 compartments
each for miniatures (FSLQ040BO)- 2 x half-size inlays with 7 compartments each for miniatures (HSLZ060BO)- 2 x full-size inlays with 16 compartments each for miniatures
(FSMEFP040BO)Dimensions- 2 * 550 mm x 345 mm x 310 mm height (refers to a distribution of the inlays on two equally sized stacks).Base area inlays- Double-size: 550 mm x
345 mm- Full-size: 345 mm x 275 mm- Half-size: 275 mm x 172 mm- The heights of the inlays depend on the sizes of the miniatures and vary between 40 mm and 210
mmTransporter- Internal dimensions: approx. 620 mm x 400 mm x 340 mm height- External dimensions: approx. 635 mm x 410 mm x 350 mm height- Front compartment: 230 mm
wide x 210 mm high
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