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GENERAL15 - GENERAL 370 Bag with storage box FSLB250 for Super Fantasy
Brawl - basic game

from 145,33 EUR
Item no.: 377333

shipping weight: 1.00 kg
Manufacturer: Feldherr

Product Description
Spacious Feldherr carrier bag for storing and transporting miniatures and game material from the base game and all expansions.Thanks to all-encompassing magic, everyday
sporting events are now pointless. To avoid dying of boredom, the inhabitants of Fabulosa created a competition of senseless violence: the "Super Fantasy Brawl".You are a fan of
raw violence paired with sporting spectacle. To prevent your miniatures from falling victim to wanton destruction, we have the right bundle for you. The Feldherr GENERAL370 bag
incl. storage box and foam inserts ensures that you don't have to worry about any details or limbs breaking off and offers space for all contents from the basic game, the terrain pack
and all expansions.- The set offers space for all miniatures, cards and the entire game material of the basic game, the terrain pack, the "Upgrade plastic token kit" and all
expansions.- The set comes with a separate insert for small game material and the playing cards.- All cards also fit with a protective cover.- Dashboards, instructions and game
board are stored separately in the bag.The set offers space for all miniatures and the entire game material from:- Super Fantasy Brawl - Basic game- Super Fantasy Brawl - The Art
of War Expansion- Super Fantasy Brawl - Circle of War Expansion- Super Fantasy Brawl - Force of Nature Expansion- Super Fantasy Brawl - Radiant Authority Expansion- Super
Fantasy Brawl - Mental Might Expansion- Super Fantasy Brawl - Hot Trick Expansion- Super Fantasy Brawl - Statues terrain pack- Super Fantasy Brawl - Upgrade plastic token
kitTo be prepared for the amount of content, we have packed 3 full-size and 2 half-size foam inserts in a sturdy Feldherr storage box. This means that all miniatures and the entire
game material are well protected and clearly organised. The box is stowed in a GENERAL370 bag so that everything can be easily transported.There is a separate, customised
compartment for each champion. Whether it's Sulka or the statue of Esmae, your models stay in place during transport. They won't slide around and, surrounded by soft foam, are
optimally protected from damage. Fragile limbs remain just as undamaged as the weapons of your champions. If you paint your figures, you can also be sure that the colours are
protected from scratches and abrasion.An individual insert with compartments for cards, base rings and tokens helps you to keep track of your game material at all times. Special
card compartments with finger-thick cut-outs are provided for the cards. These make it easier for you to remove the individual stacks. This means you always have your game
material quickly to hand. The time and nerves you save on setting up the game can be spent on spectacular arena battles instead.Even the additional upgrade plastic token kit does
not pose a major challenge for this set, as the full-size foam insert with 8 compartments still has 2 compartments for your small game material.Finally, cover the inserts with the
foam lid provided. This means that everything is surrounded by soft foam and nothing can slip out of the compartments.Dashboards, instructions and game board are stored
separately in the bag.This means that all the pieces are safely packed and ready for transport.The set consists of:- 1 Feldherr GENERAL 370 bag- 1 Feldherr storage box FSLB250-
1 half-size foam insert with 6 compartments for miniatures from the base game (HSMECO085BO)- 1 half-size foam insert with 3 compartments for statues Ragryl, Esmae and
Garnet from the Terrain Pack (HSDF085BO)- 1 full-size foam insert with 12 compartments for miniatures from the expansions (FSMEPQ060BO)- 1 full-size foam insert with 8
compartments for miniatures from the expansions + small game components (FSMEFC055BO)- 1 full-size foam insert with 13 compartments for cards + small game material
(FSLG050BO)- 1 foam lidThe storage box FSLB250 is made of coated double-walled cardboard, double-wall cardboard and is therefore both very light and particularly stable. With
the matching foam inserts, miniatures, game material and all other goods can be stored safely and protected from dust - and easily transported with the plastic carrying handle.One
side of the box can be opened completely. This makes it easier to put away and remove the foam mats. The inserts are either inserted from the top or simply pushed into the side of
the box.The black Feldherr bag, the GENERAL 370, is made of hard-wearing, water-repellent material. Continuous padding together with a reinforced base and lid ensure that the
contents are protected from external influences even when being transported by car or train. In addition to the large main compartment, there are a total of four small compartments
with waterproof zips on the outside. You can open the bag completely on one side to make it easier to put things in and out.The GENERAL 370 can be carried comfortably on the
shoulder using the wear-resistant, detachable shoulder strap or transported using the carrying handle, which is also detachable.If you don't need the bag at the moment, you can
fold it up to save space and store it in the cupboard.This ensures that all miniatures are safely and neatly stowed away and ready for transport to the next battle.Dimensions of the
compartments:- Each of the 12 compartments of the FSMEPQ060BO is 78 mm long x 73 mm wide x 50 mm deep- Each of the 8 compartments of the FSMEFC055BO is 122 mm
long x 74 mm wide x 45 mm deepThe 13 compartments of the FSLG050BO have the following dimensions:- 3 compartments: 97 mm long x 71 mm wide x 40 mm deep- 6
compartments: approx. 78 mm long x 52 mm wide x 40 mm deep- 4 compartments: approx. 42 mm long x 23 mm wide x 40 mm deep- Each of the 6 compartments of the
HSMECO085BO is 80 mm long x 73 mm wide x 75 mm deep. The four corner compartments each have a rounded corner- Each of the 3 compartments of the HSDF085BO is 152
mm long x 80 mm wide x 75 mm deepDimensions of the FSLB250 storage box:- Internal dimensions: 345 mm x 275 mm x 250 mm- External dimensions: 355 mm x 290 mm x 260
mmDimensions of the GENERAL 370 bag:- Internal dimensions: approx. 410 mm x 330 mm x 370 mm- External dimensions: approx. 430 mm x 330 mm x 380 mmThe foam inserts
have the following dimensions:- HSMECO085BO / HSDF085BO: 275 mm x 172 mm x 85 mm total height (75 mm usable height + 10 mm foam base)- FSLG050BO: 345 mm x 275
mm x 50 mm total height (40 mm usable height + 10 mm foam base)- FSMEFC055BO: 345 mm x 275 mm x 55 mm total height (45 mm usable height + 10 mm foam base)-
FSMEPQ060BO: 345 mm x 275 mm x 60 mm total height (50 mm usable height + 10 mm foam base)- high-quality, fine-pored foam - Made in Germany- chlorine-free and acid-free
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