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GENERAL11 - GENERAL 370 Bag with storage box FSLB310 for Soulblight
Gravelords

from 145,33 EUR
Item no.: 377084

shipping weight: 1.00 kg
Manufacturer: Feldherr

Product Description
With this Feldherr GENERAL 370 bag, you can transport up to 119 miniatures of your Soulblight Gravelords army safely and comfortably. To ensure that nothing happens to your
army on the way to the next battle, you get the matching Feldherr GENERAL 370 bag here, filled with an FSLB310 storage box and plenty of foam. So you are prepared for all
eventualities and never lose track of the abundance of miniatures. The set consists of:- 1 Feldherr General bag GENERAL370- 1 Feldherr storage box FSLB310- 1 full-size foam
insert with 32 compartments for e.g. Deadwalker Zombies (FSMEDS040BO)- 2 half-size foam inserts with 12 compartments each for e.g. Vargheists and smaller miniatures. e.g.
Vargheists and smaller models (HS075A028)- 2 half-size foam inserts with 10 compartments each for e.g. Fell Bats or the Vampire Lord (HS070A030)- 1 half-size foam insert with 7
compartments for e.g. Lauka Vai or a Vengorian Lord (HSMFDV090BO)- 1 half-size foam inlay with 10 compartments for e.g. Belladamma Volga, Radukar The Wolf, Radukar The
Beast, Radukar's Court (HS080A008)- 1 half-size foam inlay with 10 compartments for e.g. Graveguards (HSMFDV090BO) e.g. Graveguards (HSMEFF050BO)- 1 half-size foam
insert with 16 compartments for e.g. Deadwalker Zombies (HS040BF05BO)- 1 foam lidEach miniature in your collection has its own custom-fit compartment. This keeps your
models safely in place during transport. The soft foam not only protects the delicate parts of your figures. The colours of painted miniatures are just as safe from abrasion and
scratches. Dimensions of the compartments:- Each of the 32 compartments of the FSMEDS040BO is 54 mm long x 35 mm wide x 30 mm deepThe 24 compartments of the two
HS075A028 have the following dimensions:- 4 compartments: 90 mm long x 80 mm wide x 65 mm deep- 4 compartments: 80 mm long x 55 mm wide x 65 mm deep- 16
compartments: 36 mm long x 33 mm wide x 65 mm deepThe 20 compartments of the two HS070A030 have the following dimensions:- 12 compartments: 33 mm long x 33 mm wide
x 60 mm deep- 4 compartments: 104 mm long x 84 mm wide x 60 mm deep- 4 compartments: 57 mm long x 47 mm wide x 60 mm deepThe 7 compartments of the two
HSMFDV090BO have the following dimensions:- 1 compartment: 55 mm long x 40 mm wide x 80 mm high- 2 compartments: 65 mm long x 40 mm wide x 80 mm high- 2
compartments: 70 mm long x 40 mm wide x 80 mm high- The two circular compartments have a diameter of 33 mm.The 10 compartments of the two HS080A008 have the following
dimensions:- 6 compartments: 45 mm long x 45 mm wide x 70 mm deep- 2 compartments: 98 mm long x 67 mm wide x 70 mm deep- 2 compartments: 67 mm long x 45 mm wide x
70 mm deepThe 10 compartments of the two HSMEFF050BO have the following dimensions:- 8 compartments: 54 mm long x 41 mm wide x 40 mm deep- 2 compartments: 54 mm
long x 93 mm wide x 40 mm deepEach of the 16 compartments of the HS040BF05BO is 54 mm long x 35 mm wide x 30 mm deep.The supplied foam lid closes the whole thing and
ensures that your figures are packed securely all round.The FSLB310 storage box is made of coated, double-wall cardboard and is therefore very light yet stable. The attachable lid
reliably protects the contents from dust and other external influences. The two plastic-reinforced carrying handles on the sides make the box easy to transport. The black Feldherr
bag, the GENERAL 370, is made of hard-wearing, water-repellent material. Continuous padding together with a reinforced base and lid ensure that the contents are protected from
external influences, even when being transported by car or train. In addition to the large main compartment, there are a total of four small compartments with waterproof zips on the
outside. You can open the bag completely on one side to make it easier to put things in and out. The wear-resistant, detachable shoulder strap allows you to carry the GENERAL
370 comfortably on your shoulder or with the carrying handle, which is also detachable.If you don't need the bag, you can fold it up to save space and store it in the
cupboard.Dimensions of the GENERAL 370 bag:- Inside: approx. 410 mm x 330 mm x 370 mm- Outside: approx. 430 mm x 330 mm x 380 mmDimensions of the storage box:-
Inside: 350 mm x 285 mm x 310 mm- Outside: 380 mm x 310 mm x 320 mmThis ensures that all miniatures are safely and neatly stowed away and ready for transport to the next
battle.The foam inserts have the following dimensions:- FSMEDS040BO: 345 mm x 275 mm x 40 mm total height (30 mm usable height + 10 mm foam base)- HSMFDV090BO: 275
mm x 172 mm x 90 mm total height (80 mm usable height + 10 mm foam base)- HS080A008: 275 mm x 172 mm x 80 mm total height (70 mm usable height + 10 mm foam base)-
HS075A028: 275 mm x 172 mm x 75 mm total height (65 mm usable height + 10 mm foam base)- HS070A030: 275 mm x 172 mm x 70 mm total height (60 mm usable height + 10
mm foam base)- HSMEFF050BO: 275 mm x 172 mm x 50 mm total height (40 mm usable height + 10 mm foam base)- HS040BF05BO: 275 mm x 172 mm x 40 mm total height (30
mm usable height + 10 mm foam base)
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