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FSLB310P62 - Storage box FSLB310 for Necrons

from 64,47 EUR
Item no.: 377543

shipping weight: 1.50 kg
Manufacturer: Feldherr

Product Description
The galaxy is ripe for conquest. You send out armies of your soulless warriors to conquer the galaxy.To ensure that nothing can go wrong with your plan and that your Necrons
reach the battlefield unscathed, this Feldherr storage box is filled to the brim with individual foam inserts. This allows you to transport more than 80 miniatures safely to the
battlefield.Spread over one full-size and 7 half-size inserts, this storage box stores over 80 miniatures from your army. Precisely fitting compartments for each individual model
ensure that the figures do not slide around or bump into each other during transport. This also protects the colours of the painted Necrons from abrasion and scratches.You need a
fearsome leader on your raids, and of course he needs a suitable inlay to recover between battles. 14 compartments offer you space for up to 14 miniatures of your army. Illuminor
Szeras and a retinue of Immortals, Flayed Ones and models with similar dimensions will find suitable compartments in the insert.The insert with the three large compartments is
ideal for storing larger Necron miniatures. For example, you can safely store your Catacomb Command Barge/Annihilation Barge (without flying base) or Canoptek Wraiths here.Up
to 5 Necron miniatures can be safely stored in this Feldherr half-size foam insert. The different sized compartments are ideal for storing larger miniatures such as a Canoptek
Reanimator as well as standard models in a well-organised and well-protected manner.The half-size foam insert with 6 large compartments is ideal for storing and transporting
medium-sized Necron models neatly and safely.The insert is particularly suitable for Destroyers or Tomb Blades, for example.Additional Tomb Blades and Destroyers can be safely
stored in the insert with 12 compartments. You can also store Neuron Warriors or miniatures with similar dimensions here.The remaining two half-size trays each have 10
compartments with space for a total of 20 standard infantry miniatures from your army. They are particularly suitable for storing Necron warriors, deathmarks and models with similar
dimensions.You can store up to 22 miniatures in the full-size foam tray. It is particularly suitable for Necron Warriors, Flayed Ones and infantry models of a similar size.Finally, the
supplied foam lid ensures that your figures are safely packed and survive transport to the gaming table undamaged.The FSLB310 storage box is made of coated, double-walled
cardboard and is therefore very light yet stable. The attachable lid reliably protects the contents from dust and other external influences. The two plastic-reinforced carrying handles
on the sides make the box easy to transport.
Details- high-quality, fine-pored foam - Made in Germany- chlorine-free and acid-freeContents- 1 Feldherr storage box FSLB310- 1 half-size foam insert for Illuminor Szeras and a
further 13 miniatures (HSMEDK085BO)- 1 half-size foam insert for 3 miniatures (e.g. Annihilation Barge / Necron Catacomb Command Barge / Canoptek Wraiths (HSDF085BO) - 1
half-size foam insert for 5 miniatures (e.g. Annihilation Barge / Necron Catacomb Command Barge / Canoptek Wraiths) (HSDF085BO)- 1 half-size foam insert for 5 miniatures of
different sizes (HSMEYG075BO)- 1 half-size foam insert for 6 miniatures such as Destructors / Destroyers or Tomb Blades (HSMECO075BO)- 1 half-size foam insert for 12
miniatures of different sizes (HSMEDK085BO)foam inlay for 12 miniatures of different sizes (HSCW075BO)- 1 half-size foam inlay for 10 standard infantry miniatures
(HSLM050BO)- 1 half-size foam inlay for 10 standard infantry miniatures (HSMEFF050BO)- 1 full-size foam inlay for 22 standard infantry miniatures (FSMEZZ050BO)- 1 foam mat,
5 mm, as height compensation- 1 foam coverDimensionsInlay with 14 compartments- 2 compartments: 100 mm long x 88 mm wide x 75 mm deep- 2 compartments: 43 mm long x
33 mm wide x 75 mm deep- 2 compartments: 33 mm long x 33 mm wide x 75 mm deep- 8 compartments: 33 mm long x 28 mm wide x 75 mm deepInsert with three large
compartments- 3 compartments each 150 mm long x 79 mm wide x 75 mm deepHalf-size foam insert- 1 compartment: 137 mm long x 76 mm wide x 65 mm deep- 2 compartments:
87 mm long x 76 mm wide x 65 mm deep- 2 compartments: 76 mm long x 40 mm wide x 65 mm deepHalf-size foam insert- 6 compartments each 80 mm long x 73 mm wide x 65
mm deep - four corner compartments each have a rounded cornerInsert with 12 compartments- 2 compartments: 90 mm long x 80 mm wide x 65 mm deep- 2 compartments: 80
mm long x 55 mm wide x 65 mm deep- 8 compartments (4 with rounded corner): 36 mm long x 33 mm wide x 65 mm deepHSLM050BO - 4 compartments: 64 mm long x 44 mm
wide x 40 mm deep- 4 compartments: 60 mm long x 44 mm wide x 40 mm deep- 1 compartment: 75 mm long x 40 mm wide x 40 mm deep- 1 compartment: 50 mm long x 40 mm
wide x 40 mm deepHSMEFF045BO - 8 compartments: 54 mm long x 41 mm wide x 35 mm deep- 2 compartments: 54 mm long x 93 mm wide x 35 mm deepFull-size foam insert-
12 compartments: 60 mm long x 45 mm wide x 40 mm deep- 6 compartments: 65 mm long x 45 mm wide x 40 mm deep- 4 compartments: 73 mm long x 40 mm wide x 40 mm
deepStorage box- Inside: 350 mm x 285 mm x 310 mm- Exterior: 380 mm x 310 mm x 320 mmFoam inserts- HSMEDK085BO / HSDF085BO: 275 mm x 172 mm x 85 mm total
height (75 mm usable height + 10 mm foam base)- HSMEYG075BO / HSMECO075BO / HSCW075BO: 275 mm x 172 mm x 75 mm total height (65 mm usable height + 10 mm
foam base)- HSLM050BO / HSMEFF050BO: 275 mm x 172 mm x 50 mm total height (40 mm usable height + 10 mm base)- FSMEZZ050BO: 345 mm x 275 mm x 50 mm total
height (40 mm usable height + 10 mm foam base)
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