
Item no.: 377652

FSLB250P16 - Storage box FSLB250 for Altar Quest - Basic game

from 50,20 EUR
Item no.: 377652

shipping weight: 1.20 kg
Manufacturer: Feldherr

Product Description
Aridika, the legendary land still casts a spell over adventurers today. You and your fellow soldiers explore abandoned ruins and uncover the secrets of the scorched earth.Packed
with detailed miniatures, Altar Quest brings the eerie surroundings of Aridika to life. To ensure that your figures are always well stored, we have the matching Feldherr storage box
including customised foam. Keep your models, game cards and game accessories neat and well protected.The set offers space for all miniatures, game decks and the complete
accessories from the "Altar Quest" base game by Blacklist Games. All game cards also fit with sleeves. You can store the rulebook, story guide and game board separately between
the foam lids.All Altar Quest game contents are neatly and safely stored on a total of five foam inserts. Precisely fitting compartments for each individual model ensure that the
figures do not slide around or bump into each other during transport. This means that the colours of your painted adventurers and villains are spared abrasion and scratches.A
full-size insert with 32 compartments and 2 half-size inserts with 16 compartments each are available for most miniatures. You can organise all your Minions and door models here.
The two Villians Gert and Wynora and the Locked Chest can be placed in the remaining compartments.The large miniature of the villain Bolx the Belchlord has a suitable
compartment in the high insert with 7 compartments. The Altar, Blessed Fountain, Alchemy Desk and Book Case can be stored here, as can the Plastic Rings and the Card Divider.
The large rectangular compartment is reserved for the card dividers. You divide the miniatures and plastic rings between the other compartments.Your hero models and other items
such as Mystical Mirror, Weapon Rack and Fungal Patch will find a quiet place in the two smaller compartments. You also have space for cards and tokens here.However, the
majority of your cards and tokens are stored in the large tray with 13 compartments. There are three equally sized compartments in the centre for your cards. You sort your tokens
into the remaining compartments. This keeps everything clear and organised and you have everything quickly to hand.All the playing cards fit in the insert, even with protective
sleeves.Finally, two foam lids ensure that your figures are securely packed all round. You can store the rulebook, story guide and game board separately between the lids.The
FSLB250 storage box is made of coated, double-walled cardboard and is therefore both very light and particularly sturdy. With the matching foam inserts, miniatures, game material
and all other goods can be stored safely and protected from dust - and easily transported with the plastic carrying handle.One side of the box can be opened completely. This
makes it easier to put away and remove the foam mats. The inserts are either inserted from the top or simply pushed into the side of the box.
Details- high-quality, fine-pored foam - Made in Germany- chlorine-free and acid-freeContents- 1 Feldherr storage box FSLB250- 1 full-size foam insert with 32 compartments for
miniatures (FSMEDS040BO)- 2 half-size foam inserts with 16 compartments each for miniatures (HS035BF05BO)- 1 half-size foam insert with 7 compartments for Card Divider,
plastic rings, bolx and terrain (HSMEME070BO)- 2 half-size foam inserts with 7 compartments each for cards, heroes and terrain (HSMEQO050BO)- 1 full-size foam insert with 13
compartments for cards and tokens (FSLG050BO)- 2 foam lidsDimensions- Storage box internal dimensions: 345 mm x 275 mm x 250 mm height- External storage box
dimensions: 355 mm x 290 mm x 260 mm heightInlays- HS035BF05BO: 275 mm x 172 mm x 35 mm total height (25 mm usable height + 10 mm foam base)- HSMEME070BO: 275
mm x 172 mm x 70 mm total height (60 mm usable height + 10 mm foam base)- HSMEQO050BO: 275 mm x 172 mm x 50 mm total height (40 mm usable height + 10 mm foam
base)- FSMEDS040BO: 345 mm x 275 mm x 40 mm total height (30 mm usable height + 10 mm foam base)- FSLG050BO: 345 mm x 275 mm x 50 mm total height (40 mm usable
height + 10 mm foam base)
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