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FSLB310P23 - Storage box for Maggotkin of Nurgle

from 48,83 EUR
Item no.: 377802

shipping weight: 0.60 kg
Manufacturer: Feldherr

Product Description
You can recognise them from afar, the followers of the plague god. The stench of decay is just as hard to hide as their bodies covered in plague and disfigured by disease. After all,
their unusually friendly and cheerful god gives them plenty of gifts. And they are only too happy to share them, spreading them just as generously across the mortal realms.We
cannot protect Nurgle's faithful from their inner decay and infirmity, but we can give the miniatures of your Nurgle army a long, happy life with this case.There are 2 compartments on
the first foam mat, cut to fit two Pusgoyle Blightlords on their mounts. These can alternatively be occupied by the Lord of Afflictions and an accompanying Pusgoyle Blightlord.In
addition to the Lords of the Rotbringers, the Beast of Nurgle also has a customised compartment. The slimy monster in the service of the Plague Lord is safely stored here along
with its claws and tentacles.2 further compartments can be filled with miniatures of your choice. They are ideal for the Lord of Blights and Rotbringer's Sorcerer, among others.The
two square compartments are each 70 mm long x 70 mm wide x 100 mm deep.The second foam insert has space for three Plague Drones. There is a precisely tailored
compartment for each of the three wardens in the Nurgle's garden.The sensitive parts, such as wings, plague trunks and the blades of the Plaguebearer, are optimally protected
from damage here.There is also a further compartment on the insert for the Horticulous Slimux.The wrinkly gardener on his snail-like mount, Mulch, also has a safe place here,
away from Nurgle's garden, and he can continue to execute enemies on the snail shell with his Lopping Shears without being damaged.There are two more foam inserts to
complete your army. The warriors of your battle line can assemble here, for example.The two mats are each divided into 30 compartments of different sizes, which can be filled with
miniatures of your choice. They are ideal for models of the Plaguebearers of Nurgle or Putrid Blightkings.The precisely fitting compartments ensure that the miniatures stay in place
and do not bump into each other, even on uneven terrain. Your models, which have been coloured in after hours of painting, are therefore safe from scratches and chipped paint.A
matching foam lid ensures that everything is safely packed away.Of course, the inserts fit exactly into the storage box. This is made of coated, double-walled cardboard and is
therefore both very light and very sturdy. The lid reliably protects the contents from dust and other external influences.Caution!Not suitable for children under 36 months.
Scope of delivery- 1 Feldherr storage box FSLB310- 1 full-size foam insert for Pusgoyle Blightlords, Beast of Nurgle and 2 other miniatures (FSMEFW110BO)- 1 full-size foam insert
for Plague Drones and Horticulous Slimux (FSMEFX115BO)- 2 full-size foam inserts with 30 compartments each (FSFJ045BO)- 1 matching foam lidDimensionsThe total of 60
compartments of the two inserts have the following dimensions:- 16 compartments: 74 mm long x 32 mm wide x 45 mm deep- 32 compartments: 50 mm long x 32 mm wide x 45
mm deep- 12 compartments: 50 mm long x 46 mm wide x 45 mm deepDimensions of the storage box- Internal dimensions: 350 mm x 285 mm x 310 mm- External dimensions: 380
mm x 310 mm x 320 mmFeatures- High-quality, fine-pored foam - Made in Germany- Chlorine-free and acid-free
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